
Fwd: 23208 - 2nd and Clay - Seattle WA ASR #1
Pat Mutzel /USA  do: andrzej.lach@cavatina.pl 06/02/2024 12:33 PM

See below regarding sign on property 

Pat Mutzel 

425-466-8567

Pat.Mutzel@cushwake.com

From: Finch, Michael <MichaelFinch@CenturyPacificLP.com>

Sent: Sunday, June 2, 2024 10:27:35 AM

To: Pat Mutzel/USA <Pat.Mutzel@cushwake.com>

Subject: RE: 23208 - 2nd and Clay - Seattle WA ASR #1 

 

Confirmed – Consistent with the PSA, Cavatina has permission to install a public notice to the extent 

required by the City of Seattle.  If there are questions about location of the posting, I’d like Cavatina’s 

third-party consultant installing the signage to coordinate with Mark Munday.  Please forward me the 

contact information for the party who will install the City-required public notice.  Thank you.

 

 
MICHAEL E. FINCH
PRINCIPAL

CenturyPacific, LLLP

O: 206.757.8895 | M: 206.618.4694

centurypacificlp.com 

 

From: Pat Mutzel/USA <Pat.Mutzel@cushwake.com> 

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 6:09 PM

To: Finch, Michael <MichaelFinch@CenturyPacificLP.com>

Subject: Fwd: 23208 - 2nd and Clay - Seattle WA ASR #1

 
[EXTERNAL]

 
Please confirm we have permission to install a public notice about cavatinas proposed  
development.
 
Pat Mutzel 
425-466-8567
Pat.Mutzel@cushwake.com

From: Andrzej_Lach/cavatina%CAVATINA@cavatina.pl <Andrzej_Lach/cavatina%CAVATINA@cavatina.pl

>

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 5:19:26 PM

To: Terence Russell <trussell@epsteinglobal.com>; Pat Mutzel/USA <Pat.Mutzel@cushwake.com>



Cc: andrzej.lach@cavatina.pl <andrzej.lach@cavatina.pl>; Ed Curley <ecurley@epsteinglobal.com>

Subject: ODP: 23208 - 2nd and Clay - Seattle WA ASR #1 
 

Hello Terrence, 

See attached and signed. Ready for invoicing. 

  

Pozdrawiam / Regards, 

Andrzej Lach, CMIT 
Development Project Manager 
cell: 708-745-2059 
e-mail: andrzej.lach@cavatina.pl 

Od:        "Terence Russell" <trussell@epsteinglobal.com> 
Do:        "andrzej.lach@cavatina.pl" <andrzej.lach@cavatina.pl> 
DW:        "Ed Curley" <ecurley@epsteinglobal.com> 
Data:        05/30/2024 10:01 AM 
Temat:        23208 - 2nd and Clay - Seattle WA ASR #1 

Andrew, 
Jodi did not want to be involved in the procurement of the signage beyond soliciting the estimate , so 

Epstein will coordinate this effort . 
I created an additional service request for this effort  (attached).  It is only for the cost of the signs and their 
installation.  If you can get Cavatina to sign this request then we will be able to order and pay for them at  

the appropriate time.  We have listed this cost as a reimbursable amount on the May invoice . 
  
Please call with questions. 
  
Thanks 

  
Ter ence 
  
  
Terence Russell, AIA 
Senior Project Manager 
  



EPSTEIN 
Building on Experience  
  
Architecture | Interiors | Engineering | Construction 
  
600 West Fulton Street 
Chicago, Illinois 60661-1259 
D +1-312-429-8199 
C +1-630-544-1086 
trussell@epsteinglobal.com 
www.epsteinglobal.com 
  
Mission 
Epstein is a multi-disciplinary design and construction company focused on 

serving our clients, empowering our employee-owners, and enhancing our communities. 
  
 

The information contained in this email (including any attachments) is confidential, may be subject to legal or 

other professional privilege and contain copyright material , 

and is intended for use by the named recipient(s) only. 

Access to or use of this email or its attachments by anyone else is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful . If you 

are not the intended recipient(s), you may not use, disclose, 

copy or distribute this email or its attachments (or any part thereof), nor take or omit to take any action in reliance  

on it. If you have received this email in error, please notify 

the sender immediately by telephone or email and delete it , and all copies thereof, including all attachments, from 

your system. Any confidentiality or privilege is not waived 

or lost because this email has been sent to you by mistake. 

Although we have taken reasonable precautions to reduce the risk of transmitting software viruses , we accept no 

liability for any loss or damage caused by this email or its  

attachments due to viruses, interference, interception, corruption or unapproved access. 

For information on how your personal information is processed , including information on how to 

exercise state or country specific Privacy Rights please view our privacy notice here: 

https://www.cushmanwakefield.com/en/privacy-and-cookies 


